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TOILET SEAT COVER 1/2 FOLD 20/250
1 100 CS 5000 PER CASE 50 RA-I $33.00 NO BID $33.70 $35.98 $25.80 $27.00 $28.20 NO BID $38.99 $40.44 $33.30 $32.13 $25.70 $29.00 NO BID
NATURAL ROLL PAPER TOWEL NO
SUBSTITUTE 7.75" X 625/ROLL 1 PLY 1-
3/4" CORE NATURAL EMBOSSED
2 1000 CS HARDWOUND, 12 ROLL/CASE GP26200 $68.00 NO BID $29.13 NO BID $29.43 $28.80 $27.49 NO BID $71.25 NO BID $27.05 $31.36 $30.11 $33.80 NO BID
DISPENSERS, TOILET TISSUE, SAN
JAMAR JUMBO, COLOR: SMOKE, HOLDS
TWO 9" TOILET TISSUE ROLLS (4 PER
3 12 CS CS) NO SUBSTITUTE R4000TBK $24.00 NO BID $22.95 NO BID NO BID $118.00 $82.68 NO BID $28.34 $29.74 NO BID NO BID $29.11 $79.45 NO BID
GEORGIA PACIFIC VISTA LEVER ACTION
HARDWOUND ROLL TOWEL DISPENSERS
4 60 EA NO SUBSTITUTE GEP54338 $39.00 NO BID $23.37 NO BID $23.62 $29.00 $21.92 NO BID $62.84 NO BID $21.95 NO BID $25.30 $28.60 NO BID
$18.75 thru
12/31/08 and
TOILET PAPER JUMBO JR 2PLY 1000FT $20.83 from
5 1150 CS WHITE 3-1/8" CORE 12 ROLLS/CASE $37.00 NO BID 1/1/09-6/30/09 NO BID $26.78 $18.25 $25.94 NO BID $38.99 $37.40 $21.05 $26.80 $20.35 $20.75 NO BID
$16.14 thru
12/31/08 and
REGAL MULTIFOLD HAND TOWEL #00489- |#00489-12 AG- $17.93 from
6 20 CS 12 AG-780 780 $27.00 NO BID 1/1/09-6/30/09 NO BID $21.98 $15.80 $17.08 NO BID $36.95 $22.94 NO BID $19.80 $15.60 $16.70 NO BID
WINDSOR VACUUM BAGS FOR
SENSOR,GENERIC,10 VAC BAGS PER
7 12 PKS PACKAGE W-5300 $27.00 NO BID $9.15 NO BID $10.15 $9.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.24 $11.13 $11.30 NO BID
VACUUM BAGS HOOVER TYPE A 3 PER
8 3 CS PACK/12 PACKS PER CASE 4010001A $7.00 NO BID $52.56 NO BID $15.36 $79.00 $65.28 NO BID $35.80 NO BID NO BID $14.09 NO BID $28.56 NO BID
VACUUM BAGS, PRO-TEAM LINE VACER
9 10 PKS (100 PER CS) PT100291 $295.00 NO BID $23.68 NO BID NO BID $18.99 $17.90 NO BID $29.95 NO BID NO BID $8.18 $44.50 $22.80 NO BID
WINDSOR SENSOR "S" 12 INCH UPRIGHT
VACUUM MODEL SRS12 INCLUDESON
BOARD CREVICE AND UPHOLSTERY
10 4 EA TOOLS. NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID $309.39 NO BID $357.94 $299.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WAND, DOUBLE CURVE 2PC. ALUM. FOR
11 12 PKS WINDSOR VAC PAC MODEL VP6 2443 NO BID NO BID $34.24 NO BID $30.15 $32.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.86 NO BID $43.25 NO BID
RUBBERMAID FLOOR SWEEP 6.5" SWEEP
12 5 EA PATH. NO SUBSTITUTE RCP4212GRA NO BID NO BID $31.53 $51.99 NO BID $33.90 $27.95 NO BID $48.60 $37.06 NO BID $69.40 $38.10 $31.16 NO BID
BRISTLE SHOD DRY TOOL FOR WINDSOR
13 2 BOX VP6 VAC PAC WINO02003 NO BID NO BID $36.88 NO BID NO BID $34.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
VACUUM BAG, PAPER 10/PKG FOR
14 5 PKS JAVELIN 28 (UNISOURCE ) U19856 NO BID NO BID $44.13 NO BID $42.47 $30.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $68.86 NO BID $31.50 NO BID
HOSE ASSEMBLY FOR WINDSOR VAC
15 18 EA PAC MODEL VP6 NO SUBSTITUTE 68066 NO BID NO BID $22.84 NO BID $20.10 $24.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $29.00 NO BID
VACUUM BAG, WINDSOR VACPAC
16 40 PKS FILTERS (VP6) (10/PK 20 PKS/CS) W-68075 NO BID NO BID $18.06 NO BID $19.48 $13.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.76 NO BID $24.30 NO BID
PRO-TEAM BACKPLATE SYSTEM
COMPLETE INC. STRAPS FOR COACHVAC
17 7 EA & SUPER COACHVAC 100631 NO BID NO BID $75.80 NO BID NO BID $48.99 $70.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $46.55 $44.13 $45.65 NO BID
WINDSOR STRAP ASSYEMBLY FOR VP6
18 12 EA VACUUM CLEANER 68058 NO BID NO BID $22.16 NO BID $20.73 $24.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $33.00 NO BID
WINDSOR SENOR S 15" VACUUM
19 3 EA CLEANER W-SRS15 NO BID NO BID $380.09 NO BID $340.59 $425.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 4 EA WINDOSR VAC PAC 6QT W-VP6 NO BID NO BID $354.74 NO BID $356.86 $366.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
RUBBERMAID WASTEBASKETS 14-3/8"L X
10-1/4"W X 15"H PACK OF 12 COLOR:
21 4 CS BLACK NO SUBSTITUTE 2956-00BLA $5.50 NO BID $55.08 $83.88 $59.04 $53.88 $4.02 NO BID $82.60 $45.81 NO BID NO BID $4.75 $53.76 $49.80
CONTAINER, 44 GALLON CONTINENTAL
22 6 EA GARBAGE 4444GY $52.00 NO BID $33.88 $45.95 $36.25 $25.00 $23.41 NO BID $52.00 $49.54 NO BID $26.51 $30.15 $24.19 $38.00
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RUBBERMAID SLIM JIM WASTE
CONTAINERS WITH HANDLES 23 GALLON

23 8 EA RECTANGULAR NO SUBSTITUTE RCP3554 NO BID NO BID $30.08 $59.95 NO BID DISCONTINUED $32.90 NO BID $38.66 $44.61 NO BID NO BID $36.30 $35.40 $36.55
MOP HANDLES WITH SPRING GRIP

24 35 EA UNISAN UNS609 $10.00 NO BID $7.28 $10.99 NO BID $20.00 $7.75 NO BID $14.39 $14.75 NO BID $7.29 $10.75 $7.72 $10.85
MOP HEADS SUPER LOOP MEDIUM

25 8 CSs GREEN 5IN HEAD BAND (12EA/CS) UNS-502GN $68.00 NO BID $4.24 $84.99 $50.37 $28.00 $67.44 NO BID $138.15 $41.51 NO BID $61.06 $3.55 $78.49 $85.30
MOP HEADS SUPER LOOP BLUE 5IN

26 8 Cs HEAD BAND (12EA/CS) HIL24986 $68.00 NO BID $4.24 NO BID $52.85 $28.00 $74.88 NO BID $116.03 $41.51 NO BID $65.03 $5.80 $78.40 $120.00
MOP HEADS, 240Z COTTON STRING

27 16 Cs (12EA/CS) UNS-324C $55.00 NO BID $2.71 $69.95 $34.10 $29.50 $44.88 NO BID $92.56 $71.15 NO BID $31.04 $3.95 $52.56 $54.00
RUBBERMAID WAVEBRAKE MOPPING
SYSTEM - MOP BUCKET & WRINGER
SYSTEM, 35 QUART CAPACITY. COLOR

28 6 EA YELLOW NO SUBSTITUTE RCP7577-88YEL $88.00 NO BID $83.06 $109.95 $87.99 $81.48 $83.72 NO BID $136.03 $121.41 NO BID $87.50 $82.47 $79.95 $84.69
RUBBERMAID HANDLE, INVADER, ALUM
60" SIDE GATE ANTIMICROBIAL WET MOP

29 12 EA HANDLE RCPH126 $13.50 NO BID $10.41 $15.99 NO BID $10.70 $10.23 NO BID $21.82 $14.26 NO BID NO BID $13.90 $11.90 $11.00
ZEP HANDSOAP ZEP DELIGHT LIQUID "GOJO INDS"

30 107 Cs (4-1GAL PER CS) CEB74402 $25.00 NO BID $14.92 NO BID NO BID $16.00 $19.20 NO BID NO BID $132.89 NO BID $13.72 $15.40 $14.75 $17.25
ZEP HANDSOAP, F-10 POWERED (6 PER

31 11 CSs CS) 95711 $50.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $34.62 $27.00 NO BID $54.22
HANDSOAP, GOJO MICRELL 1000ML

32 100 Cs ANTIBACTERIAL SOAP 10EA/CS GOLD M4 7188 $77.00 NO BID $65.21 NO BID NO BID $67.44 $62.60 NO BID $54.78 $152.24 NO BID $57.75 NO BID $63.00 NO BID
GOJO7255 1GG92, HAND SOAP WITH
PUMICE FOR MEDIUM SOIL, E4, QUICK
ACTING HAND CLEANER WITH

33 3 () SCRUBBIING PARTICLES PKG OF 4 $58.00 NO BID $49.72 $79.95 $50.39 $59.65 $46.08 NO BID $74.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID $58.40 $48.00 $48.54

34 66 Cs PURE CLEAN CARPET CLEANER (4/CS) 208-01 $47.00 NO BID $33.80 NO BID NO BID $30.00 $26.60 NO BID NO BID $34.83 NO BID $27.34 $28.85 $20.75 $109.08
TILE CLEANER, ZEP CERAMIC (4 GAL PER

35 6 Cs CS) NO SUBSTITUTE 127324 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $263.57 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $22.43
HILLYARD ARESENAL #22 CITRUS SCRUB

36 24 Cs 1GA (4 PERCS) NO SUBSTITUTE HIL0082206 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $159.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $25.44
HILLYARD CITRIC SHOWER FOAM (1GAL)

37 10 Cs NO SuB HIL0017406 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $69.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $35.91
HILLYARD DESCALER METAL BRIGHTNER

38 10 Cs (4 GAL PER CS) NO SUBSTITUE HIL0047406 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $49.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.89
HILLYARD EXTRA STRENGTH CSP
CLEANER (4 GAL PER CS) NO

39 10 Cs SUBSTITUTE HIL0012506 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $60.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $35.91
HILLYARD Q.T. DISINFECTANT CLEANER

40 10 Cs (4 GAL PER CS) NO SUBSTITUTE HIL0016706 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $60.92 NO BID NO BID NO BID $183.97 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $76.24
HILLYARD: ARSENAL RE-JUV-NAL #16
DISINFECTANT/CLEANER 1GA (4 PER

41 50 Cs CS) NO SUBSTITUTE HIL0081606 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $76.84 NO BID NO BID NO BID $130.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.72
HILLYARD: SUPROX RESTROOM

42 10 Cs CLEANER 1 GAL 4/CS HILO016706 $35.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $75.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.61 42.90- NO BID $23.89
HILLYARD: #14 CARPET PRE SPRAY &

43 10 () EXTRACTION FOR ICAP 1/2GAL , 6 PER CS HILL0081422 $47.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $104.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID $166.30 NO BID NO BID $28.35 NO BID $109.08

44 6 () HILLYARD: LIQUID ENZYME II. HIL0101404 $36.00 $137.50 $41.04 NO BID NO BID $44.28 $34.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $33.24 $32.25 $39.60 $33.60
CHAMPION: GUM-GO 60Z 12/CS GUM

45 10 CSs REMOVER 5165 $39.00 $127.50 $28.08 $26.98 $40.20 $24.00 $24.00 NO BID $38.65 $190.91 NO BID $26.57 $21.60 $27.60 $32.81
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BUCKEYE ACTION PAK WORKOUT HD
SPRAY AND WIPE CLEANER(5 GAL BOX)
46 32 BX NO SUBSTITUTE 5007-5000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $77.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $56.67
WHITE BOARD CLEANER EXPO FOR DRY |"SANFORD"
47 12 () ERASE SURFACES 80Z NO SUBSTITUTE|SAN81803 NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.76 NO BID NO BID $35.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.25 $23.04
WHITE BOARD CLEANER EXPO FOR DRY
48 2 Cs ERASE SURFACES #81800 4GA/CS 180630 $33.00 NO BID NO BID $75.96 NO BID $52.00 $86.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $79.00 $15.51
HILLYARD CREME CLEAN (12QT PER
49 2 () CASE) HIL0010604 $29.00 $112.20 $32.40 NO BID $27.24 $40.68 $21.00 NO BID NO BID $130.28 NO BID $26.63 $26.95 $32.00 $32.61
C2/3 SUPROX GERERAL PURPOSE
50 10 Cs CLEANER 1/2 GAL H-70422 $31.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $76.02 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.63 NO BID NO BID $23.54
51 15 () C2/3 RE-JUV-NAL DISINFECTANT 1/2 GAL |H-70522 $35.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $68.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.72
52 6 Cs GUM, TAR AND OIL REMOVER - BUCKEYE $31.00 NO BID $66.36 NO BID $93.24 NO BID NO BID $47.30 NO BID $83.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.73
TRIGGER SPRAYER FOR PLASTIC
53 200 EA BOTTLES IMP9112 $0.55 NO BID $0.38 *$0.79 $0.57 $0.31 $0.60 NO BID NO BID $0.88 NO BID $0.58 $0.43 $0.43 $0.51
54 200 EA CONTINENTAL PLASTIC BOTTLES 24 OZ. | CMC924B $0.76 NO BID $0.35 * $0.45 $0.46 $0.32 $0.33 NO BID $1.26 $1.89 NO BID $0.46 $0.40 $0.37 $0.42
SQUEEGES, UNGER 12 INCH BRASS
55 15 EA CHANNEL GC300 $6.00 NO BID $4.58 $6.99 NO BID $3.20 $4.00 NO BID $6.89 $4.24 NO BID $3.71 NO BID $3.89 $4.58
SQUEEGES, UNGER 16 INCH BRASS
56 15 EA CHANNEL GC400 $6.00 NO BID $5.55 $8.99 NO BID $3.99 $4.72 NO BID $7.26 $5.09 NO BID $4.40 NO BID $4.74 $5.96
57 10 EA UNGER PRO BRASS SQUEEGE HANDLES GSOO $8.00 NO BID $4.58 $6.99 NO BID $4.60 $4.00 NO BID $16.36 $4.53 NO BID $3.64 $4.50 $3.99 $4.58
58 6 EA FLOOR SQUEEGEE, STRAIGHT, 24" C-2400 $17.00 NO BID NO BID $11.95 NO BID $16.90 $11.40 NO BID $23.82 $16.41 NO BID $12.00 $8.90 $16.90 $14.70
THICKSTER PF POWDER FREE GLOVES
TEXTURED GRIP, EXTENDED CUFF, 14
MIL THINCK, EXAM GRADE LATEX, #6603-
20 LARGE, 50 GLOVES PER BOX, 10
59 4 Cs BOXES PER CASE $10.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $68.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.47 NO BID NO BID $46.50 NO BID $36.50
THICKSTER PF POWDER FREE GLOVES
TEXTURED GRIP, EXTENDED CUFF, 14
MIL THINCK, EXAM GRADE LATEX, #6603-
20 MEDIUM, 50 GLOVES PER BOX, 10
60 15 Cs BOXES PER CASE $10.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $68.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.47 NO BID NO BID $46.50 NO BID $18.25
THICKSTER PF POWDER FREE GLOVES
TEXTURED GRIP, EXTENDED CUFF, 14
MIL THINCK, EXAM GRADE LATEX, #6603-
20 XLARGE, 50 GLOVES PER BOX, 10
61 27 Cs BOXES PER CASE $10.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $68.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $46.50 NO BID $18.25
THICKSTER PF POWDER FREE GLOVES
TEXTURED GRIP, EXTENDED CUFF, 14
MIL THINCK, EXAM GRADE LATEX, #6603-
20 SMALL, 50 GLOVES PER BOX, 10
62 1 BOXES PER CASE $10.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $68.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.47 NO BID NO BID $46.50 NO BID $36.50
BUCKEYE JUGGERNAUT FLOOR
STRIPPER HD ULTIMATE 4 X 1 GALLON
63 30 Cs PER CASE NO SUBSTITUTE 5028-1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $106.68 NO BID $104.96 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $49.21
BUCKEYE PROCLAIM WAX/SEALER
FLOOR FINISH (4-1GAL. PER CS) NO
64 30 Cs SUBSTITUTE 5150-1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $110.56 NO BID $100.13 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $38.09
BUCKEYE CASTLEGUARD WAX (4-1GAL
65 10 Cs PER CS) NO SUBSTITUTE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $106.32 NO BID $181.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.00
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66 12 EA 1907 HILLYARD GYM FINISH 2.5 GAL PAILS H-83033 NO BID NO BID $100.86 NO BID NO BID $87.72 $321.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HILLYARD TACK IT COURT PREP 4 PER

67 1 Cs CASE H-7581 NO BID NO BID $32.64 NO BID NO BID $75.48 $142.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HILLYARD SUPER SHINE ALL 4 GAL PER

68 1 Cs CASE H-1401 NO BID NO BID $23.12 NO BID NO BID $79.56 $21.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $72.60
TOTAL 3-IN-1 FURNITURE POLISH (12 PER

69 3 Cs CASE) A1087 $39.00 $112.20 $32.76 $29.95 NO BID $28.00 $18.96 NO BID NO BID $25.09 NO BID $24.45 NO BID $42.00 $34.10

70 8 Cs STAINLESS STEEL POLISH, AEROSOL K-SSA $49.00 $117.30 $49.08 $27.95 $34.20 $42.00 $24.24 NO BID $94.68 $18.97 NO BID $33.69 $25.80 $29.90 $41.28
MAXI PADS 250 PER/CS SIZE NO. 4 FOR

71 4 Cs VENDING MACHINES 4-147 $50.00 NO BID $25.82 $28.95 $31.93 $25.50 $23.24 NO BID $66.12 $34.34 NO BID $22.90 $31.50 $25.49 $20.27
KRAFT WAXED PAPER LINERS FOR

72 8 () SANITARY NAPKIN DISPOSAL, 500 CASE | HS260/KL/260 $19.00 NO BID $12.94 $16.95 $16.20 $18.00 $12.42 NO BID $33.84 $22.80 NO BID $12.78 $17.50 $11.98 $13.19

73 4 () NATURALLE: TAMPONS 500 PER CS 25176488 $70.00 NO BID $54.65 $55.95 $64.08 $48.00 $49.10 NO BID NO BID $57.24 NO BID $50.91 $58.35 $49.96 $52.51

74 5 () STRIPPING PAD, 20 INCH BLACK 400120 $17.00 NO BID $12.75 $13.99 $15.50 $13.40 $13.50 NO BID $18.75 NO BID NO BID $14.36 $18.45 $13.98 $16.68
LIGHT DUTY SCOUR PAD WHITE 6X9

75 10 () 20EA/CASE HIL28939 $17.00 NO BID $5.01 $11.99 $4.37 $3.20 $15.90 NO BID $11.85 $18.34 NO BID $5.40 $4.60 $11.97 $6.45
CONTINENTAL BUFFING PAD, 20INCH

76 5 () HOG HAIR CMC20403 $22.00 NO BID $13.80 $14.98 $17.05 $14.20 $19.25 NO BID $19.03 NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.45 $15.98 $25.80
HEAVY DUTY SCRUB PADS, GREEN 6X9

7 15 () 15EA/CS AB-20GH $17.00 NO BID $4.65 $11.95 $4.69 $3.50 $13.08 NO BID $5.90 $9.43 NO BID $17.05 $5.95 $3.85 $5.80
CONTINENTAL BLUE CLEANING PADS

78 3 BX 5300, 14 INCH CMC20203 $24.00 NO BID $40.95 $8.99 NO BID $8.80 $7.95 NO BID $15.38 NO BID NO BID $11.90 $11.37 $9.70 $11.00

79 3 () STRIPPING PAD, HI PRO 7300, 17 INCH 3M#MCO-08275 $12.00 NO BID $37.25 $37.95 $35.73 $16.00 $28.40 NO BID $62.98 NO BID NO BID $27.58 $35.05 $23.88 $38.12

80 10 EA 20" 60 GRIT SCREEN PAD N-2060 $62.00 NO BID NO BID $5.50 NO BID $8.80 $5.95 NO BID $8.90 NO BID NO BID $8.62 $8.87 $7.60 $7.31

81 10 EA 20" 80 GRIT SCREEN PAD N-208D $52.00 NO BID $8.52 $4.98 NO BID $8.10 $5.01 NO BID $7.92 NO BID NO BID $7.17 $8.50 $6.30 $6.37

82 10 EA 20" 120 GRIT SCREEN PAD N-20120 $42.00 NO BID $6.06 $3.25 $73.98 $8.33 $3.92 NO BID $6.89 NO BID NO BID $5.10 $5.00 $6.20 NO BID
WOOD HANDLES ACS 60 INCHES WITH

83 48 EA METAL THREAD TIP B1260 $5.00 NO BID $2.87 $2.59 $3.42 $1.66 $2.30 NO BID $4.32 $4.91 NO BID $2.50 $2.65 $3.00 $2.36
RUBBERMAID REPLACEMENT SLEEVE
FOR RUBBERMAID MICROFIBER
DUSTERITEM # RCPQ850 (6 PER CS)

84 5 () NO SUBSTITUTE RCPQ851 $10.00 NO BID $35.58 $47.94 NO BID $38.64 $5.95 NO BID $60.72 $7.91 NO BID NO BID $18.80 $39.97 $42.40
MAID BROOM, UNISAN, PLASTIC

85 12 CTN BRISTLES, WOOD HANDLE, 42" LONG UNS916P $50.00 NO BID $64.04 $69.95 NO BID $39.00 $41.16 NO BID $78.88 $5.32 NO BID NO BID $4.97 $48.72 $56.75

86 6 EA PLASTIC COUNTER BRUSHES GRAY BRU5408 $5.00 NO BID $4.26 $5.99 $9.44 $2.76 $3.46 NO BID $6.32 $3.81 NO BID $9.14 $4.27 $2.52 $4.05
LOBBY DUST PAN BROOMS RUBBERMAID

87 4 BX (6 PER BOX) RUB637400BLA $39.00 NO BID $30.36 $48.30 NO BID $28.00 $27.54 NO BID $24.30 $7.06 NO BID NO BID $36.15 $23.64 $32.00
LOBBY DUSTPAN BLACK CARLISLE 12

88 6 BX INCH DOU-PAN (SIX PER CASE) RUB200500 $5.00 NO BID $9.54 $48.18 NO BID $48.00 $18.00 NO BID $17.22 $9.41 NO BID NO BID $39.00 $49.44 $34.56

89 35 EA GROUT BRUSHES 8 1/2" LONG $2.25 NO BID $1.91 NO BID $1.50 $2.99 $1.25 NO BID $2.26 $25.41 NO BID $0.75 $1.67 $1.65 $1.23
SCRUBBING SPONGES MEDIUM DUTY 3M
SCOTCH-BRITE GREEN/YELLOW 20EA/CS

90 12 CSs NO SUBSTITUTE #74 $40.00 NO BID $29.60 $29.98 $29.96 $28.00 $28.40 NO BID $63.38 $31.15 NO BID $27.44 $30.80 $29.73 $14.17
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BID SUMMARY

BID 666

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES FOR FY 08-09

STOCKTON PYRAMID
APPROX SUGGESTED | JANITORIAL SCHOOL CENTRAL ALBERT ELKHORN CLEAN CORPORATE
ITEM | YEARLY BRAND/PART #| SUPPLIERS OMEGA SAC VAL UNIT|PRODUCTS UNIT| UNISOURCE JANITORIAL |RANDIK UNIT| BUCKEYE MERIT SYSCO UNIT/PAPER UNIT| TRADING JC NELSON SOURCE EXPRESS
# QTY u/M DESCRIPTION OR EQUAL UNIT COST UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

FLOOR SWEEP MEDIUM, FULLER

91 8 EA COMMERCIAL BLACK TAMPICO 24" 3CT-224 $12.00 NO BID $11.21 $7.99 NO BID $8.80 $9.15 NO BID $15.06 $20.54 NO BID NO BID $9.50 NO BID $8.71
FLOOR SWEEP COARSE/HEAVY,
RUBBERMAID COMMERCIAL BLACK

92 8 EA TAMPICO 24" RUB9B10BLA $12.00 NO BID $10.75 NO BID NO BID $8.80 $10.49 NO BID NO BID $15.89 NO BID NO BID $10.60 NO BID $10.72

93 120 EA TOILET BOWL MOPS #2-GS $1.75 NO BID $0.51 $0.59 $0.63 $0.45 $0.60 NO BID $2.00 $0.92 NO BID $0.56 $0.57 $0.48 $0.77

94 20 EA DUST BRUSH 5" WIDE 12" LONG OVAL UNGWALB $15.00 NO BID $13.81 $17.99 NO BID $12.00 $11.67 NO BID $16.97 $15.58 NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.00 $14.36

95 2 EA 18" T BAR H-50040 $4.00 NO BID $31.76 NO BID $4.39 $37.54 $30.08 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $31.36 $19.55 $34.00 NO BID

96 6 EA 18" REFILL FOR T BAR APPLICATOR H-50041 NO BID NO BID $8.40 NO BID $5.38 $15.20 $14.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.42 $7.15 $9.63 $8.52
60" METAL THREADED WOOD BROOM

97 2 EA HANDLE PM-60MTM $4.00 NO BID $2.52 NO BID $1.75 $3.00 $2.30 NO BID NO BID $18.05 NO BID $2.50 $2.65 $3.00 $2.36

98 6 EA DUST MOP HANDLES PM-60DMH $8.00 NO BID $5.86 $5.99 $6.92 $11.16 $5.60 NO BID $7.30 $8.67 NO BID $5.50 $6.60 $5.85 $11.20

99 6 EA DUSTO MOP REFILLS 60" PM-KK60 $17.00 NO BID $13.98 $5.75 NO BID $24.80 $20.13 NO BID $18.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.10 $13.20 $10.67

100 |12 EA 3M DOODLE PAD HOLDER 3M6473 $100.00 NO BID $9.26 $24.95 NO BID $5.99 $7.10 NO BID $35.67 $104.47 NO BID $17.09 $24.10 $7.60 $24.95

101 |15 EA GROUT LINE BRUSHES HANDLE STYLE C-365320 $250.00 NO BID $0.84 NO BID NO BID $6.99 $2.78 NO BID NO BID $9.12 NO BID $6.55 $1.36 $10.85 $1.23

"LAGASSE"

102 |5 EA 20' POLE EXTENSIONS UNGEDS550 $50.00 NO BID $48.06 $69.95 NO BID $48.00 $45.70 NO BID $66.00 $48.05 NO BID NO BID $49.67 $43.25 NO BID
DUSTER, OSTRICH FEATHER 28"

103 |22 EA OVERALL LENGTH AB/SC100 $19.00 NO BID $5.24 $6.99 $6.92 $4.99 $5.89 NO BID $16.67 $7.14 NO BID $7.45 $9.40 $10.58 $17.33
CHALK OFF CLOTH 18 INCHES X 24

104 2 Cs INCHES 144 PER CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $198.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $173.71 $165.60 NO BID NO BID
CLAIRE DUST MOP TREATMENT BY MISTY

105 |6 BX 12/CASE 14 OZ. 810-20 $45.00 NO BID $67.56 NO BID $33.26 $35.88 $41.64 NO BID $56.86 $68.20 NO BID $32.07 $37.50 NO BID $55.66

106 |24 EA GRAPPLER NIFTY NABBER FOR TOILETS UNGNN40R $25.00 NO BID $24.21 $29.95 NO BID $17.99 $16.97 NO BID $24.55 NO BID NO BID $12.70 $11.53 $16.90 $20.35
"LAGASSE" PUMP SPRAYER STANDARD 2

107 |4 EA GAL. RLF1972 $23.00 NO BID $23.91 $29.55 NO BID $24.99 $18.10 NO BID $27.13 $40.59 NO BID $35.93 $24.50 $24.60 $24.09
RUBBERMAID® MOBILE BARRIER NO

108 |4 EA SUBSTITUTE RCP 9511 $350.00 NO BID $204.25 $399.95 NO BID $291.03 $274.10 NO BID $468.00 $376.94 NO BID $312.51 NO BID $314.00 $316.00
RUBBERMAID FLOOR SIGNS "CAUTION

109 |6 EA WET FLOOR" NO SUBSTITUTE RUB6112-77YW $12.00 NO BID $9.06 $11.99 $29.29 $8.86 $8.04 NO BID $13.98 $13.42 NO BID $24.00 $9.30 $8.95 $9.87
RUBBERMAID FLOOR SIGNS "CLOSED"

110 |6 EA NO SUBSTITUTE RUB6112-78YW $12.00 NO BID $9.06 $11.99 NO BID $8.86 $8.04 NO BID $13.98 $10.94 NO BID NO BID $9.30 $8.95 $11.07
RUBBERMAID POP-UP SAFETY CONES
30" WITH MULTI-LINGUAL "CAUTION"
IMPRINT AND WET FLOOR SYMBOL  NO

111 |3 EA SUBSTITUTE 9S01 $33.00 NO BID $23.72 $39.95 NO BID $26.07 $24.84 NO BID $35.70 $33.53 NO BID $27.75 $31.25 $27.50 $29.20
6INCH MEDIUM DUTY SCRAPER BY "LAGASSE"

112 1 Cs UNGER UNGMDSC $22.00 NO BID $207.30 $30.95 NO BID $185.70 $124.60 NO BID $26.77 NO BID NO BID $7.64 $125.70 $243.50 $23.56

113 1 EA 6INCH REPLACEMENT BLADES BY UNGER MDSBO NO BID NO BID $0.84 $11.95 NO BID $7.90 $9.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.64 $10.25 $12.80 $0.89
ALPHASITE CHALK QUARTET PREMIUM  "UNITED
IVORY NO POWDER 3/8" DIAMETER 12 STATIONERS"

114 |88 Cs BX/CS QRT314005 NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.40
NORTON FABRICUT SCREENS, 180 GRIT

115 |2 PKS SCREEN 25/PK 940 NO BID NO BID $49.69 NO BID $46.00 $25.00 $36.25 NO BID $56.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $47.00 NO BID

116 |48 PKS RAZOR BLADE RETRACTABLE SCRAPER $8.00 NO BID $19.80 NO BID $1.34 $1.28 $1.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.96 $1.60 $74.00 $82.67




Bid Opening Date: SAN JOAQUIN DELTA COLLEGE

August 13, 2008 BID SUMMARY
@ 1:00 p.m., Wednesday BID 666
CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES FOR FY 08-09
STOCKTON PYRAMID
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# QTY um DESCRIPTION OR EQUAL UNIT COST UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
RUBBERMAID MICROFIBER DUSTER,
FLEXIBLE HIGH REACH 20" LONG NO
117 |10 EA SUBSTITUTE RCPQ850 $25.00 NO BID $16.11 $27.95 $17.83 $15.70 $15.62 NO BID $24.40 $20.33 NO BID $16.85 NO BID $17.40 $18.27
BAR MOPS (RAGS) 25# BOX 100%
118 |16 BOXES |COTTON, 21225 $52.00 NO BID $44.38 NO BID $60.34 $13.90 $40.10 NO BID NO BID $17.31 NO BID $51.61 $90.35 $42.50 NO BID
119 |9 EA FOAM GUN FOR HILLYARD PRODUCTS | H99215 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $62.79 $32.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID $58.70 NO BID $47.10 NO BID $45.35 NO BID
120 |1 EA CLEANING CART BY RUBBERMAID AKF32260 $160.00 NO BID $125.88 NO BID NO BID $110.00 $119.60 NO BID NO BID $164.47 NO BID NO BID NO BID $126.00 $126.67
CADDY BAGS FOR 32, 40, AND 55 GAL
121 |5 EA CONTAINERS C-3175 $32.00 NO BID $30.88 $19.95 $30.52 $26.99 $13.30 NO BID $36.70 $169.41 NO BID $20.20 $26.45 $18.48 $31.33
122 |12 EA HANGING SAFETY SIGNS RM-9S16 $22.00 NO BID $16.35 $20.95 $17.52 $15.29 $15.76 NO BID $23.90 $19.62 NO BID $18.70 NO BID $17.90 $17.60
ROUND DOLLY, FITS 20", 32", 44" AND 55
123 |3 EA GAL CANS C-3255-P $70.00 NO BID $32.40 $22.95 $40.04 $18.90 $22.02 NO BID $42.40 $35.39 NO BID $28.81 $27.05 $22.86 $41.87
124 |3 EA OPTILOC TELESCOPIC POLE 30’ ED900 $75.00 NO BID $62.62 $89.95 NO BID $63.77 $64.40 NO BID $66.02 NO BID NO BID NO BID $63.75 $59.68 $71.69
125 |22 EA UNISAN LAMBSWOOL DUSTER 35" UNS L3850 $15.00 NO BID $4.88 $10.99 $5.38 $3.22 $5.60 NO BID $13.82 $7.34 NO BID NO BID $5.00 $6.26 $4.89
Disclaimer: The bids submittals are being evaluated for completeness and accuracy. The award recommendation may be presented to the Board of Trustess at the August 26 or September 9, 2008 Board Meeting.




